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Financial position: 

 ADIs had healthy financial positions as at 31 March 2020, with total assets increasing by 16.1 per
cent to $5.6 trillion from 31 March 2019. Over the same period, gross loans and advances grew by
5.4 per cent, to $3.5 trillion. This was largely the result of a recovery in housing lending in late 2019
and early 2020.

 Growth in assets and liabilities over the year was most pronounced for the March 2020 quarter, with
COVID-19 driving larger than usual movements in balance sheet items such as liquid assets, loans
to businesses and deposit liabilities.

Capital adequacy: 

 Total capital and common equity tier 1 capital ratios were 15.7 per cent and 11.0 per cent respectively,
as at 31 March 2020. Although ADIs remain well-capitalised by historical standards, some capital
ratios have decreased from the December 2019 quarter (including common equity tier 1 ratio by 0.3
percentage points), likely reflecting early impacts of COVID-19. Factors such as abrupt changes to
capital markets, negative sentiment due to altered economic conditions, and pressure to maintain
dividend rates despite declining profitability, will continue to place capital strain on ADIs.

 Risk-weighted assets increased by 8.0 per cent from 31 March 2019, totalling $2.2 trillion as at 31
March 2020. Nonetheless, risk-weighted assets growth was outpaced by growth in total assets, with
recent economic uncertainty likely driving shifts in preferences to safer assets.



5 

Asset quality: 

 Total impaired facilities, past due items and specific provisions, as well as the proportion of these
indicators to gross loans and advances, have all increased from March 2019 levels. The change in
impaired facilities was the most significant by percentage terms, increasing by 17.4 per cent
between 31 March 2020 and 31 March 2019, to $14.3 billion. These movements likely capture the
early impacts of COVID-19 on the credit risk environment, and asset quality can be expected to
further deteroriate over the June 2020 quarter as unemployment increases. However, the recent
introduction of relief measures such as repayment deferrals may dull this impact going forward.

Liquidity: 

 Liquidity positions of ADIs have strengthened from March 2019, with recent economic uncertainty
driving ADIs to seek quality liquid assets and attract deposits. The Liquidity Coverage Ratio (LCR)
and Minimum Liquidity Holdings (MLH) ratio have increased to 150.3 per cent and 18.1 per cent
respectively, as at 31 March 2020. Current policy support measures, such as the RBA’s Term
Funding Facility, are expected to ease liquidity risks in the near-term.






